VILLAGE OF BRADLEY

ORDINANCE NO. 0-4-14-9

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2012
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

ADOPTED BY THE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
VILLAGE OF BRADLEY

This A8 day of Apth ,2014

Published in pamphlet form by authority of the Board of Trustees of the Village of
Bradley, Kankakee County, Illinois, this 2& day of A pri L ,
2014, '

CERTIFICATE:

ikl g e

Michael J. LaGesse, Village Clerk




ORDINANCE NO. 0-4-14-9

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2012
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE
VILLAGE OF BRADLEY, Kankakee County, Illinois, as follows:

Section 1. Code of Ordinances Amended. Section 10-182 (“Adopted By Reference”)
and Section 10-183 (“Amendments, Additions and Changes™) of Division 5 (“One- and Two-
Family Dwelling Code™) of Article IIl (“Technical Codes™) of Chapter 10 (*Buildings and
Building Regulations™) of the Code of Ordinances of the Village of Bradley is amended by
deleting the following stricken language and adding the underlined language to read as follows:

Sec. 10-183. Adoption of code.

The International Residential Code 2866 2012 (hereinafter the "Code"), as
published by the International Code Council is adopted as the one- and two-
family dwelling code of the village to establish minimum requirements to
safeguard the public safety, health and general welfare through affordability,
structural strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, light and
ventilation, energy conservation and safety to life and property from fire and other
hazards attributed to the built environment and to provide safety to fire fighters
and emergency responders during emergency operations.

Sec. 10-184. Amendments, additions and changes.

The building code as adopted in section 10-183 shall be amended by making the
following changes and additions:

All references within the International Residential Code referring to "P2904" shall
be stricked and replaced with "International Building Code §903, as amended".

All references within the International Residential Code referring to "ICC
Al117.1" shall be stricken and replaced with "[llinois Accessiblity Code, as
amended".

All references within the International Residential Code to the "International
Plumbing Code" shall be stricken and replaced with "Illinois Plumbing Code, as
amended”.



Section R101.1: Title.

These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-
family Dwellings of the Village of Bradley, and shall be cited as such and will be
referred to herein as “this code.”

Section R1035: Permits

Delete sub-sections 105.2(1), 105.2(2), 105.5(5) and 105.5(10) in their entirety.

Section R307 Toilet, Bath and Shower Spaces

That Section R307 shail be deleted in its entirety.
Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems
That Section R313.2 shall read as follows:

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems. An automatic
residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in one- and two-family
dwellings.

Exceptions:

(1)  An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be
required for additions or alterations to existing buildings
that are not already provided with an automatic residential
sprinkler system;

(2) Where exit access stairways serving and contained within a
single residential dwelling unit or sleeping unit in Group
R-1. R-2 or R-3 occupancies are enclosed: and

3) Where all habitable rooms have two (2) means of egress in

compliance with Chapter 10 of the International Building
Code, as amended.

R313.2.1 Design and installation.
Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall be designed and installed in
accordance with Section P2904 or NFPA 13D.

Secton R315 Carbon Monoxide Alarms

That Section R315.1 shall read as follows:

R315.1 Carben monoxide alarms. For new construction, an approved carbon
monoxide alarm shall be installed in accordance with Illinois State Fire Marshall
regulations and outside of each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of




the bedrooms in dwelling units within which fuel-fired appliances are installed
and in dwelling units that have attached garages.

That Section R315.2 shall read as follows:

R315.2 Carbon monoxide detection systems. Carbon monoxide detection
systems that include carbon monoxide detectors and audible notification
appliances, installed and maintained in accordance with this section for carbon
monoxide alarms, Illinois State Fire Marshall regulations and NFPA 720, shall be
permitted. The carbon monoxide detectors shall be listed as complying with UL
2075. Where a household carbon monoxide detection system is installed, it shall
become a permanent fixture of the occupancy, owned by the homeowner and shall
be monitored by an approved supervising station.

Exception: Where carbon monoxide alarms are installed meeting the requirements
of Section R315.1, compliance with Section 315.2 is not required.

That Section R315.3 shall read as follows:

R315.3 Where required in existing dwellings. Where work requiring a permit
occurs in existing dwellings that have attached garages or in existing dwellings
within which fuel-fired appliances exist, carbon monoxide alarms shall be
provided in accordance with Section R315.1 and Illinois State Fire Marshall

regulations.

That Section R315.4 shall read as follows:

R315.4 Alarm requirements. Single-station carbon monoxide alarms shall be
listed as complying with UL 2034 and shall be installed in accordance with this
code, lllinois State Fire Marshall regulations and the manufacturer’s installation
instructions.

Section R401 General (Foundations)

That Section R401.1 shall read as follows:

R401.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and
construction of the foundation and foundation spaces for all buildings. In addition
to the provisions of this chapter, the design and construction of foundations in
flood hazard areas as established by Table R301.2(1) shall meet the provisions of
Sectlon R322 Wood foundauons are not permitted. shal—be—designed—and




Section R402: Materials

That Section R402.1 and each of its subparts are stricken in their entirety.
Section R403 Footings

That Figure R403.1(2), Figure R403.1(3), and Section R403.2 are deleted in their
entirety.

Section 405 Foundation Drainage

That Section R405.2 is deleted in its entirety.

Section R304 Pressure Preservatively Treated-Wood Floors (On Ground)

That Section R504 shall read as follows:
R504.1 General. Pressure preservatively treated-wood basement floors and

ﬂoors on ground are prohlblted w1thm the Vlllage of Braclley sh&H—be—éesrgned




R905 Mineral-surfaced roll roofing

That Section R905 shall read as follows:
R905.5 Mineral-surfaced roll roofing.

The installation of mineral-surfaced roll roofing is prohibited within_the Village
of Bradley. shell-comply-with-this-seection:




Section N1101 General (Energy Efficienc

That Section N1101.1 shall read as follows:

N1101.1 Scope. This chapter, as amended by the State of lllinois, regulates the
energy efficiency for the design and construction of buildings regulated by this
code.

Section M1307 Appliance Installation



That Section M1307.6 shall read as follows:
M1307.6 Plumbing Connections. Potable water and drainage system
connections to equipment and appliances regulated by this code shall be in

accordance with Chapters—29—and—30 the Illinois Plumbing Code and the
regulations as set forth by the Illinois Department of Public Health.

Section M1601 Duct Construction

That Section M 1601 shall read as follows:

M1601.1 Duct Design. Duct systems serving heating, cooling and ventilation
equipment shall be installed in accordance with Ordinance 10-268 of the Village
of Bradley Code of Ordinances, the provisions of this section and ACCA Manual
D or other approved methods.

Section M2004 Water Heaters Used for Space Heating

That Section M2004.1 shall read as follows:

M2004.1 General.

Water heaters used to supply both potable hot water and hot water for space
heating shall be installed in accordance with this chapter, the Illinois Plumbing
Code Chapter24-—Chapter28 and the manufacturer’s installation instructions.

Section M2003 Water Heaters

That Section M2005.1 shall read as follows:

M2005.1 General. Water heaters shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s instructions and the requirements of this code., Water heaters
installed in an attic shall comply with the requirements of Section M1305.1.3.
Gas-fired water heaters shall comply with the requirements in the [llinois
Plumbing Code Chapter24. Domestic electric water heaters shall comply with UL
174. Oiled-fired water heaters shall comply with UL 732. Thermal solar water
heaters shall comply with Chapter 23 and UL 174. Solid-fuel-fired water heaters
shall comply with UL 2523.

Section M2101.2 System drain down.

That Section M2101.2 shall read as follows:
M2101.2 System drain down. Hydronic piping systems shall be installed to
permit draining of the system. Where the system drains to the plumbing drainage



system, the installation shall conform to the requirements of the illinois Plumbing
Code Chapters25-through 32 of thiscode.

Exception: The buried portions of systems embedded underground or under
floors.

Section M2301] Thermal Solar Energy Systems

That Section M2301.5 shall read as follows:
M2301.5 Backflow protection. Connections from the potable water supply to
solar systems shall comply with the [llinois Plumbing Code SeetionP2962-3-5.

Chapters 25-33
That Chapters 25 thru 33 shall be deleted in their entirety.

Section E3406 Electrical Conductors and Connections

That Section 3406.3 shall read as follows:
E3406.3 Minimum size of conductors. The minimum size of conductors for
feeders and branch circuits shall be +4 12 AWG copper and comply with Sections

10-136(b) and 10-138(a) of the Village of Bradley Code of Ordinances 12-AWG

atuminum. The minimum size of service conductors shall be as specified in
Chapter 36. The minimum size of Class 2 remote control, signaling and power-
limited circuits conductors shall be as specified in Chapter 43,

Section E3603: Service Entrance Conductors

DELETE E3605 and each of its subparts in its entirety.

IRC APPENDICES

Adopt Appendices A,B,C and D in their entirety.

Section 2. Severability and Repeal of Inconsistent Ordinances. If any section, paragraph,
clause or provision of this Ordinance shall be held invalid, the invalidity thereof shall not affect

any of the other provisions of this Ordinance. All existing ordinances of the Village of Bradley are
hereby repealed insofar as they may be inconsistent with the provisions of this Ordinance.

Section 3. Effective Date. The Clerk of the Village of Bradley shall certify to the
adoption of this Ordinance and shall cause it to be published in pamphlet form and this Ordinance
shall take effect upon its approval and publication in pamphlet form as so certified.



PASSED this & day of }-/I joke L ,2014

TRUSTEES:

Jerry Balthazor: Aye- _V Nay- _ Absent-
Robert Redmond:  Aye-_+«  Nay- __ Absent-
Lori Gadbois: Aye - _[ Nay-  Absent-
George Golwitzer:  Aye - _./ Nay- __ Absent- ___
Melissa Carrico: Aye - _ Nay- _ Absent-___

Eric Cyr: Aye - _|/ Nay- _ Absent-
Bruce Adams: Aye-__ Nay- __ Absent-_
TOTALS: AYE - NAY-©Q  ABSENT- O

APPROVED this L § day of /ZM/Z- ,2014

\ Lrseee (Ko

Bruce Adams, President of the Board of
Trustees of the Village of Bradiey

ATTEST:

ihdGe e,

Michael J. LaGesse, Village Clerk

10



ATTENTION ALL BUILDING
TRADES AND PERMIT
B APPLICANTS

The Village of Bradley has

adopled new building oodes as |

amended,
effecllve June 1, 2014'

International Bullding Code 2012
Intemaﬂoml Heszndemial Code

National Electric Code 2014
lntematlonalzh&echameal Code

International Fire Code 2012
international Energy Conserva-
-~ tion Coda 2012

Intemational Pro; Mainte-
. nance C:ocre 'L;gl

lntemationa%oliuel Gas Code
Intemational ongllzand Spa Code
* NFPA 101 Life Safety Code

PUBLISHER’S CERTIFICATE

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am an agent of the Kankakee
Daily Journal Company, L.L.C., duly authorized to make this certificate on
its behalf and 1 do further certify that the Kankakee Daily Journal
Company, L.L.C. is a limited liability company organized under the laws of
the State of Delaware and that said limited liability company has its offices
and place of business in the City of Kankakee, Kankakee County, Illinois,
and that it is the owner and publisher of The Daily Journal, printed,
published, and distributed in and from the City of Kankakee in the State of
{llinois, that the Daily Journal is a newspaper as hereinafter defined: which
consists of not less than 4 pages of printed matter and contains at least 130
square inches of printed matter per page; and which is printed through the
use of one of the conventionzl and generally recognized printing processes
such as offset; and which annually averages at least 25 percent news
content per issue; and which publishes miscellanecus reading matter, legal
or other notices and anncuncements, and news and information concerning
current happenings and passing events of political, social, religious,
commercial, financial or tegal nature, and advertisements or bulletins; and
which has been continuously published at regular intervals of at least once
each week with a minimum of 50 issues per years, for at least one year
prior to the first publication of the notice certified to herein.

1 do further certify that as such authorized agent of the said Kankakee
Daily Journal Company, L.L.C. that the matter or notice, a true copy of
which is hereto attached, relating to the matter of:

Building Trades And Permit Applicants Village Of Bradley
was published in said paper, during one (1) days, to-wit:

Once on June 7, 2014
Once on
Once on
Once on
Once on
GIVEN under my hand and the corporate seal of said Kankakee Daily
Journa! Company, L.L.C. this 7th day of June, A.D. 2014,

KANKAKEE DAILY JOURNAL COMPANY, L.L.C.

W : , 2, Publishers of The Daily Journal

(SEAL)

Agent of the
KANKAKEE DAILY JOURNAL COMPANY, L.L.C.

Printer’s Fees: 0.00

Paid , 20

By




